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RESEARH INTEREST 

Integrated environmental assessment of energy systems, particularly renewables, Ecodesign of 
buildings 
 
WORK EXPERIENCE 

• Professor at the Joint Graduate School of Energy and Environment (JGSEE), King 
Mongkut’s University of Technology, Thonburi (June 2010 – present). Responsibilities 
include teaching a course on life cycle assessment and supervising graduate students' 
research. Heading the "Life Cycle Sustainability Assessment Lab" at JGSEE. 

• Distinguished Adjunct Professor at the Asian Institute of Technology, (Jan 2015 onwards). 
Responsibilities include sitting on Phd committees. 

• Adjunct Professor at the Department of Environmental Sciences and Engineering, 
University of North Carolina Chapel Hill, (Jan 2012 – present). Responsibilities include 
teaching a course on life cycle assessment and supervising undergraduate students' 
Capstone projects. 

• Associate Professor at the Joint Graduate School of Energy and Environment (JGSEE), 
King Mongkut’s University of Technology, Thonburi (March 2007 – June 2010). 

• Assistant Professor at the Joint Graduate School of Energy and Environment (JGSEE), 
King Mongkut’s University of Technology, Thonburi (January 2004 – March 2007).  

• Lecturer at the Joint Graduate School of Energy and Environment, King Mongkut’s 

University of Technology, Thonburi (March 2002 – January 2004). 
• Adjunct lecturer in the Design and Engineering Management of the School of Advanced 

Technologies at the Asian Institute of Technology, Thailand (May – August 2003 / August 
– December 2004). Responsibilities included teaching part of the course "Ecodesign and 
Manufacturing Systems" and committee member of graduate student. 

• Visiting lecturer at Kasetsart University, Thailand (2002 – present). Responsibilities 
include teaching a course on " Life Cycle Assessment" at the International Program in 
Environmental Engineering. 

• Visiting lecturer at Naresuan University, Thailand (2001 – 2004). Responsibilities included 
teaching a course on environmental management for hotels. 

• Research Engineer at the Urban Environmental Engineering and Management Program, 
Asian Institute of Technology (June 2001 – February 2002). Responsibilities included 
conducting research on life cycle assessment of air conditioning systems, assisting with 
computer classes on an LCA software, SimaPro, and sharing lectures in ecodesign course. 

• Research Associate at the Environmental Engineering Program, Asian Institute of 
Technology (September 1995 – May 2001). Responsibilities included conducting research 



on wastewater nitrogen removal technologies, assisting in organizing workshops, seminars 
and training programs, preparing scientific publications and project reports. 

• Design Engineer at F. Harley and Co. Pvt. Ltd. (1992 – 1993). Responsibilities included 
design of air pollution control equipment such as bagfilters, cyclones and dust suppression 
systems, installation of the designed systems, site supervision, project proposal 
preparation, bidding and client contact. 
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